
Bid Item: Gasoline & Diesel Fuel Pumpelly Oil Acquisition 

Bid Number SB-2014-PW-172 Contract Extended 337-625-117

Effective Period: January 1, 2017 until December 31, 2017 Vince Liggi

Dept Personnel Div of Engineering & Public Works

Item #

1 Regular Unleaded Gasoline

Estimated

Annual 

Usage

OPIS

10/13/14

Margin on 

Bid

OPIS

10/13/14

Margin on 

Bid

OPIS

10/13/14

Margin on 

Bid

East Maintenance Facility

Swift Plant Road, Lake Charles 139,000 2.3740 0.1867 NO BID NO BID 2.27030 0.2386

West Maintenance Facility

Post Oak Road, Sulphur 26,500 2.3740 0.1867 NO BID NO BID 2.27030 0.2386

Other Calcasieu Parish

Police Jury Sites (Not Transport Loads) 7,500

2 Diesel Fuel (#2 Ultra Low Sulphur) (Taxed)

East Maintenance Facility

Swift Plant Road, Lake Charles 64,500

West Maintenance Facility

Post Oak Road, Sulphur 51,000

Other Calcasieu Parish

Police Jury Sites (Not Transport Loads) 1,000

3 Diesel Fuel (Off Road)-Dyed

 

OPIS

10/13/14

Margin on 

Bid

OPIS

10/13/14

Margin on 

Bid

OPIS

10/13/14

Margin on 

Bid

East Maintenance Facility

Swift Plant Road, Lake Charles 20,000 2.5985 0.0460 2.6136 0.1225 2.61530 0.0439

West Maintenance Facility

Post Oak Road, Sulphur 29,000 2.5985 0.0460 2.6136 0.1225 2.61530 0.0439
Other Calcasieu Parish

Police Jury Sites (Not Transport Loads) 46,000

SEE BID TABS

SB-2016-CERTC-171

SEE BID TABS

SB-2016-CERTC-171

SEE BID TABS

SB-2016-CERTC-171

SEE BID TABS

SB-2015-PW-183

Gayle Newton Kevin Daigle

260-203-3820 (f) 337-558-7383 (f) 337-625-1151 (f)

10% Bid Pref 10% Bid Pref

Vendor Vendor Vendor

Petroleum Traders 

Corporation

LM Daigle Oil 

Distributors, LLC

1-800-348-3705 x 1002 337-558-7247
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