
# Form Size Code Price Form Size Code Price

1 DOG Pro Pack-Science Diet® Adult Advanced Fitness Original for Dogs Dry 40 lb bag 6735 $34.28 Dry 40 lb bag 6735 NO BID

2 PUPPY  Healthy Development Small Bites Dry 15.5 lb.bag 9368 $23.03 Dry 15.5 lb.bag 9368 NO BID

3 PUPPY Healthy Development  Dry 30.0 lb bag 9367 $40.71 Dry 30.0 lb bag 9367 NO BID

4 CAT Pro Pack - Science Diet® Adult Optimal Care® Original for Cats Dry 20.0 lb bag 6801 $29.16 Dry 20.0 lb bag 6801 NO BID

5 KITTEN Healthy Development Original Dry 15.5 lb bag 9392 $34.07 Dry 15.5 lb bag 9392 NO BID

6 Pro Pack - Science Diet® Sensitive Stomach & Skin for DOGS Dry 40.0 lb bag 4045 $36.91 Dry 40.0 lb bag 4045 NO BID

7 Pro Pack - Science Diet® Sensitive Stomach & Skin for CATS Dry 20.0 lb bag 4046 $31.13 Dry 20.0 lb bag 4046 NO BID

8 PUPPY Gourmet Chicken Entrée Canned 12 x 13 oz. 7036 $17.64 Canned 12 x 13 oz. 7036 NO BID

9 ADULT Gourmet Beef Entrée Canned 12 x 13 oz. 7039 $17.64 Canned 12 x 13 oz. 7039 NO BID

10 ADULT Gourmet Chicken Entrée Canned 12 x 13 oz. 7037 $17.64 Canned 12 x 13 oz. 7037 NO BID

11 ADULT Treats Beef Jerky Treat 12 x 7.1 oz. 1874 $41.88 Jerky Treat 12 x 7.1 oz. 1874 NO BID

12 ADULT GRAIN FREE Treats Chicken & Apples Baked Biscuit 12 x 8 oz. 3032 $41.88 Baked Biscuit 12 x 8 oz. 3032 NO BID

13 KITTEN Liver & Chicken Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6600 $22.80 Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6600 NO BID

14 KITTEN Savory Salmon Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6173 $22.80 Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6173 NO BID

15 ADULT Liver & Chicken Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6610 $22.80 Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6610 NO BID

16 ADULT Savory Salmon Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 4536 $22.80 Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 4536 NO BID

17 ADULT Savory Seafood Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6612 $22.80 Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6612 NO BID

18 ADULT Treats Grain Free Salmon Crunchy Treat 2 x 6 x 2.1 oz. 2142 NO BID Crunchy Treat 2 x 6 x 2.1 oz. 2142 NO BID

19 a/d® Canine/Feline Urgent Care CANNED 24 x 5 1/2 oz cans 5670 $38.61 CANNED 24 x 5 1/2 oz cans 5670 NO BID

20 i/d® Canine Digestive Care with Turkey CANNED 12 x 13 oz cans 7008 $22.40 CANNED 12 x 13 oz cans 7008 NO BID

21 i/d® Canine Digestive Care Chicken Flavor DRY 8.5 lb bag 8618 $24.13 DRY 8.5 lb bag 8618 NO BID

22 w/d® Feline Digestive/Weight Management with Chicken CANNED 24 x 5 1/2 oz cans 9455 $29.30 CANNED 24 x 5 1/2 oz cans 9455 NO BID

# Form Size Code Price Form Size Code Price

23 Country Vet Naturals 24-14 Healthy Diet for DOGS DRY 35 lb bag NO BID DRY 35 lb bag $25.00

24 Country Vet Naturals 28-18 PUPPY Formula DRY 35 lb bag NO BID DRY 35 lb bag $27.80

25 Country Vet Naturals 24-10 SENIOR Formula DRY 35 lb bag NO BID DRY 35 lb bag $25.00

Item#18 

Discontinued

Description

SCIENCE DIET® CANINE Treats

SCIENCE DIET® FELINE Wet

SCIENCE DIET® FELINE Crunchy CreationsTM Treats

Prescription Diet® Brand Pet Foods - Canine

Prescription Diet® Brand Pet Foods  - Feline

BRAND SPECIFIC CANINE FOOD (COUNTRY VET NATURALS)

Animal Services 877-473-8384 (f) 337-528-2734 (f)

Description

SCIENCE DIET® CANINE Life Stage Products

SCIENCE DIET® CANINE Wet

Effective Period August 1, 2016 until July 31, 2017 Dennis Conea Jeff Granger

Dept Personnel Division of Engineering & Public Works 785-368-5845 337-527-6610

Bid Title Canine & Feline Food Vendor Vendor

Bid Number SB-2016-AS-147 Hill's Pet Nutrition Sales Fletcher's Feed & Farm #4


