Bid Title Mosquito Control Chemicals (Annual) Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Pro Pest and Lawn Clarke Mosquito Control
Bid Number: SB-2016-MC-178 Univar USA Service Products, Inc. Adapco, Inc. Target Specialty Products
Effective Period: January 1, 2017 until December 31, 2017 713-826-0637 318-584-7217 800-323-5727 800-367-0659 800-901-9746
Dept Personnel: Mosquito Control Department John Wesr Royal Tyler Brian Irby Jason Trumbetta Mike Nichols
SECTION &
ITEM # Description Measure 630-443-3070 (f) 866-330-9888 (f) 713-682-4374(f)
| Malathion
250 gallon mini bulk tote /gal 48.50 NO BID NO BID 48.50 NO BID
1] Dibrom 14° Concentrate
A 30 gallon drum NO BID NO BID NO BID 208.31 NO BID
B 4 or more 30 gallon drums /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID 206.01 NO BID
1] Flit 10 % EC®
A 1 gallon container /gal 41.08. 47.50. 166.99 NO BID 43.34.
B 2.5 gallon container /gal NO BID NO BID 166.99 NO BID NO BID
Permethrin 10%
v Scourge® Insecticide
A 30 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
B 55 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID 500.39 NO BID
\' Duet®
A 55 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID 148.00 NO BID NO BID
B 275 gallon tote /gal NO BID NO BID 148.00 NO BID NO BID
Vi Permanone® 31-66 . .
30 gallon drum /gal 79.20 85.00 79.01 80.85 96.80
ml kontrol kontrol
vil Talstar P
A 1 gallon /gal 32.00 35.00 NO BID NO BID 56.50
B 4 gallon case /gal 32.00 29.50. NO BID 44.65 48.50.
master line b- maxx Bifen
Vil Demand CS
1 case of 8/ 8 oz containers /cs 280.00 289.00 NO BID NO BID 260.80
IX Mavrik Perimeter
1 case of 12/ 8 oz containers Jcs NO BID NO BID NO BID 374.99 330
X ULV Mosquito Master 412 0
55 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID 63.91 NO BID NO BID
275 gallon tote /gal NO BID NO BID 63.91 NO BID NO BID
Xl DeltaGard . .
30 gallon drum /b NO BID NO BID NO BID 170.37 NO BID
Xi VectoBac® GS Granules
A 40 Ib bags /lb NO BID NO BID 1.75 1.56. NO BID
B 1,600 Ibs (1 pallet) /b NO BID NO BID 1.63 1.54. NO BID
Xl Vectolex® CG Granules . .
A 40 Ib bags /lb NO BID NO BID 5.97 5.57. NO BID
B 1,600 Ibs (1 pallet) /lb NO BID NO BID 5.83 5.43. NO BID
XIv Vectomax® CG
A 40 Ib bags /lb NO BID NO BID 8.65 NO BID NO BID
B 1,600 Ibs (1 pallet) /b NO BID|NO BID 8.48 NO BID NO BID
XV FOURSTAR 180 Day Microbial Briquests . .
220 briquets/case Jcase NO BID NO BID NO BID 669.17 NO BID
Xvi ALTOSID XR Briquets 0 a
220 pouches/case /case 710.60 760.00 710.60 710.60 710.6
Xvii ALTOSID Pellets WSP 0 a
800 pouches/case /case 648.00 NO BID 648.00 648.00 648
XVl Natular XRT o o
220 tablets/case /case NO BID NO BID 928.40 NO BID NO BID
XIX CocoBear™Mosquito Larvicide Oil . .
55 gallon drum /gal 7.17. NO BID 16.85 NO BID NO BID
XX Ditrac® All-Weather BLOX Specifications 0
A 40 cases/640 lbs /case 2.23. 59.72 NO BID NO BID 44.31
B 80 cases/1280 Ibs /case 2.23. 59.72 NO BID NO BID 44.31
XXI Kaput Mini Blocks
A 40 cases/640 lbs /case 82.00 25.50. NO BID NO BID 84
B 80 cases/1280 Ibs /case 82.00 24.95. NO BID NO BID 72.90
XX Terad3 BLOX .
A 40 cases/320 lbs /case 54.44 30.50. NO BID NO BID 46.62
B 80 cases/640 Ibs /case 54.44 30.00. NO BID NO BID 46.62
XX Fastrac BLOX 0 0
A 40 cases/320 lbs /case 98.99 55.00. NO BID NO BID 87.02
B 80 cases/640 Ibs /case 98.99 54.50. NO BID NO BID 87.02
XXIV Final Blox Rat and Mouse Bait .
A 40 cases/640 lbs /case 335.96 95.00 NO BID NO BID 78.00
B 80 cases/1280 Ibs /case 335.96 94.00 NO BID NO BID 75.33




Bid Title

quito Control Ct Is (Annual) Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Pro Pest and Lawn Clarke Mosquito Control
Bid Number: SB-2016-MC-178 Univar USA Service Products, Inc. Adapco, Inc. Target Specialty Products
Effective Period: January 1, 2017 until December 31, 2017 713-826-0637 318-584-7217 800-323-5727 800-367-0659 800-901-9746
Dept Personnel: Mosquito Control Department John Wesr Royal Tyler Brian Irby Jason Trumbetta Mike Nichols
SECTION &
o Measure
ITEM # Description 630-443-3070 (f) 866-330-9888 (f) 713-682-4374(f)
XXV T1 Mouse Prebaited Stations 4 pk
Per per 4 pack (prebaited stations) /case 79.98 89.50 NO BID NO BID 69
XXVI T1 Rat Disposable Bait Stations . .
Price per case (8 stations/case) /case 50.96 55.00 NO BID NO BID 43.82
XXvil Trapper Glue Boards 5 5 5
Price per case(48 Trapper Glue Boards) /case 49.99 62.00 NO BID NO BID 40.99




