Pumpelly Oil

Acquisition Lard Oil Company Inc Smittys Supply Inc
Bid Item: BULK OIL, FLUIDS & LUBRICANTS Vince Liggio Wade Stephens Danny Tillmam
Bid Number: SB-2016-PW-132 contract extended 337-625-1117 225-664-3311 800-256-7575

Effective Period:

November 1, 2016 until October 31, 2017

337-625-1151(f)

225-664-3217 (f)

985-748-3004 (f)

Dept Personnel:

Division of Engineering & Public Works

10% Bid Preference

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Item# Engine Oils uoMm

1 Super All Season Group |l Engine Oil, 5W30 Quart 2.48 NO BID NO BID
2 Super All Season Group 11 Engine Oil, 5W30 5 gallon 44.50 NO BID NO BID
3 Super All Season Group |l Engine Qil, 5W30 55 gallon 430.00, 430n NO BID
Qil Brand: Conoco Syn-Blend Mobil NA|
Oil Type: 5W30! Special NA
4 Super All Season Group Il Engine Oil, 10W30 Quart 2.48 NO BID NO BID
5 Super All Season Group 11 Engine Oil, 10W30 5 gallon 44.50 NO BID NO BID
6 Super All Season Group Il Engine Oil, 10W30 55 gallon 434.50 450.00 NO BID
Qil Brand: Conoco Syn-Blend Mobil NA|
Qil Type: 5W30 Special NA|
7 Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 Quart 2.70 NO BID NO BID
8 Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 5 gallon 48.05 58.00! NO BID
9 Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 55 gallon 450.00 450n NO BID
10 Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 BULK/Gallon 7.00 7.00. NO BID
Qil Brand: Conoco Fleet Ec Mobil NA
Oil Type: 15WA40| Fleet| NA

Item# Lransmission Fluic 5
11 Mercon V ATF (Automatic Transmission Fluid) Quart NO BID 3.13. NO BID
12 Mercon V ATF (Automatic Transmission Fluid) 5 gallon NO BID 59.88. NO BID
13 Mercon V ATF (Automatic Transmission Fluid) 55 gallon NO BID 559.00. NO BID
Oil Brand: NA Mobil NA
Oil Type: NA| ATF DM NA|

Jtem# Dexron®-VI Automatic Transmission Oil )
14 Dexron®-VI Automatic Transmission Oil 5 gallon NO BID 87.30. NO BID
15 Dexron®-VI Automatic Transmission Oil BULK /Gallon NO BID 13.60. NO BID|
Oil Brand: NA Mobil NA
Oil Type: NA| Dexron VI NA

Item# Super Hydraulic Oil 68 Oil .
16 Megaflow AW 68 Oil 5 gallon 39.00 50.00] NO BID
17 Megaflow AW 68 Oil BULK /Gallon 5.87 6.40 NO BID
Oil Brand: Conoco Megaflo Mobil NA
Oil Type: Nuto H 68 NA

Item# Tractor Hydraulic Fluid (PowerTran) .
18 Tractor Hydraulic Fluid, PowerTran 5 gallon 39.00 50.00! NO BID
19 Tractor Hydraulic Fluid, PowerTran BULK /Gallon 5.90 6.60 NO BID
Oil Brand: Conoco Mobil NA
Qil Type: Pwrtran Mobilfluid 424 NA

Item# Universal Gear Lubricants .
20 Universal Gear Lubricant, 80-90 5 gallon 55.00 NO BID NO BID
21 Universal Gear Lubricant, 80-90 BULK /Gallon 9.00 NO BID NO BID
Qil Brand: Conoco UGL| NA| NA|
Qil Type: NA NA NA
22 Universal Gear Lubricant, 85-140 5 gallon 55.00 NO BID NO BID
23 Universal Gear Lubricant, 85-140 BULK /Gallon 9.00 NO BID NO BID
Oil Brand: Conoco UGL| NA| NA|
Qil Type: NA| NA| NA

Item# Motorcraft .
24 Motorcraft, SAE, 5W20 Quart 3.75 NO BID NO BID
Qil Brand: NA| NA| NA|
Qil Type: NA| NA| NA|
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Item# Castrol
25 Castrol (10W-30) Quart NO BID NO BID 3.33
26 Castrol (10W-30) 5 gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 Castrol (10W-30) 55 gallon NO BID NO BID 640.99
28 Castrol (10W-30) BULK/Gallon NO BID NO BID 11.65
Oil Brand: NA NA Castrol
Qil Type: NA NA GFS
WASTE OIL - PER GALLON PRICE BIDDER WILL PAY THE PARISH (CPPJ) FOR ITS WASTE OIL - AS IS
Price Per Gallon Price Per Gallon Price Per Gallon
Item# Facility Bidder Will Pay Bidder Will Pay Bidder Will Pay
Waste Oil Tank Capacity - 1000 gallons
29 (East and West Maintenance Facilities) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Waste Oil Tank Capacity - 150 gallons
30 (Mosquito Control) NO BID NO BID NO BID




