
Vendor Vendor Vendor

Bid Title: Port Aggregates, Inc.

Apeck Aggregate Supply 

LLC DP Aggregates, LLC

Bid Number: 337-824-7625 337-239-6353 337-433-3900

Effective: Kirk Trahan Thomas W Gashim Rick Sprigg

Dept Personnel: 337-824-7777 (f) 337-238-3685 (f) 337-433-8895 F

Description

Item #

Section A 

Asphalt SurfaceTreatment 

GRAY Limestone Only

(FOB Bidders Site)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

1 Size #7 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 Size #8 NO BID NO BID 7022B 37.50

Item #

Section B

Surface Course Aggregate

(FOB Bidders Site)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

3 #57 57s 28.95 TCS#567 29.00. NO BID

4 Size #689 689s 34.95 TCS#568 35.94. NO BID

5 610 Limestone (White) 610s 26.25 TCS#115 26.42. 7002A 28.85.

6 #57 GRAY Limestone ONLY 57g 36.95  NO BID 7004B 37.50.

7 #67 GRAY Limestone ONLY  NO BID  NO BID 7008B 37.50

8 #610 GRAY Limestone ONLY 610g 33.95  NO BID 7002B 34.00.

Item #

Section C 

Surface Course Aggregate

(Delivered) (Limestone Only)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

9 #57 - Zone 1 NO BID TCS#567 34.00 NO BID

10 Size #689 - Zone 1 NO BID TCS#568 40.94 NO BID

11 610 Limestone (White) - Zone 1 NO BID TCS#115 31.42 NO BIDNO BID

12 #57 GRAY Limestone ONLY - Zone 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID

13 #610 GRAY Limestone ONLY - Zone 1 NO BID NO BID NO BIDNO BID

14 #57 - Zone 2 NO BID TCS#567 35.50 NO BID

15 Size #689 - Zone 2 NO BID TCS#568 42.44 NO BID

16 #610 Limestone (White) - Zone 2 NO BID TCS#115 32.92 NO BIDNO BID 47.00

17 Size #57 GRAY Limestone ONLY - Zone 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 Size #610 GRAY Limestone ONLY - Zone 2 NO BID NO BID NO BIDNO BID

19 #57 - Zone 3 NO BID TCS#567 41.00 NO BID

20 Size #689 - Zone 3 NO BID TCS#568 47.95 NO BID

21 #610 Limestone (White) - Zone 3 NO BID TCS#115 38.42 NO BID36.97 36.97

22 Size #57 GRAY Limestone ONLY - Zone 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID

23 Size #610 GRAY Limestone ONLY - Zone 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Item #

Section D

Road Base Aggregate

 (FOB Bidders Site)                                 

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

24 Size #610 610s 26.25 TCS#115 26.42 7002A 28.85.

Item #

Section E- Rip Rap 

(FOB Bidders Site)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

25 Class 30 LB rrt 52.50  NO BID 7024C 53.00.

26 Class 2 LB 1x4g 36.95  NO BID 7016B 37.50.

Item #

Section F- Flume Sand

(FOB Bidders Site)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

Product

Code/

Part 

Number

Bid Price

(Per Ton)

27 Flume Sand flume 14.00  NO BID 7005D 14.75.NO BID NO BID

 Westlake, LA  Iowa, LA  Westlake, LAPlant Location:

Crushed Stone

SB-2016-PW-166 

October 1, 2016 until March 31, 2017 

Div of Engineering & Public Works


