Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bid Title: Collection Sewer Pipe & Fittings Louisiana Utilities Supply Coburn Supply Co. Lafayette Winwater Works Co. Inc.
Bid Number: SB-2016-PW-141 337-625-3300 337-474-0526 337-269-0032
Effective: August 1, 2016 until January 31, 2017 JERRY MAYEAUX JOHN DROST BRYAN LAVERGNE
Dept Personnel: Division of Engineering & Public Works 337-625-2629 F 337-474-0987 F 337-269-1130 F
Product Brand Product Brand Product Brand

ltem # Description Code Name Price [U/M Code Name Price|| U/M Code Name Price u/m
1 1” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe P40BEPG SANDERSON 0.40| /ft 0.25. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 0.50 /ft
2 1 1/4” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe P40BEPH SANDERSON 0.51f /ft 0.37. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 0.60 /ft
3 11/2” SCH 40 PVC Pipe P40BEPJ SANDERSON 0.59| /ft 0.37. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 0.65 /ft
4 2” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe P40BEPK SANDERSON 0.79| /ft 0.44. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 1.00 /ft
5 2” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 SDR26BPK SANDERSON 0.60[ /ft 0.42. /ft N/A VINYLPLEX 0.50 /ft
6 2 1/2” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe P40BEPL SANDERSON 1.10) /ft 0.69. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 1.50 /ft
7 3” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 SDR26BPM DIAMOND 0.79| /ft 0.70. /ft N/A VINYLPLEX 0.95 /ft
8 3” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe P40BEPM SANDERSON 1.66| /ft 0.98. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 2.00 /ft
9 4” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 SDR26BPP DIAMOND 1.26f /ft 1.15. /ft N/A VINYLPLEX 1.30 /ft
10 4” SCH 40 SW PVC Pipe P40BEPP SANDERSON 2.05( /ft 1.20. /ft N/A JM-EAGLE 2.50 /ft
11 6” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 SDR26BPW DIAMOND 2.73|| /ft 2.48. /ft N/A VINYLPLEX 2.65 /ft
12 8” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 SDR26BPX DIAMOND 4.64( /ft 4.22. /ft N/A VINYLPLEX 4.50 /ft
13 2” x11/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTKH CONTINENTAL|| 85.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID eall 5161-17-0715-00 Continental 115.00 ea
14 21/2” x 1 1/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle 3225 FLOCONTROL|| 80.00 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea|| HT2-291837-212 SPEARS 100.00 ea
15 3” x11/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTMH CONTINENTAL|| 80.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID eall 5161-19-0715-00 Continental 100.00 ea
16 4” x 1 1/4" PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTPH CONTINENTAL|| 95.00 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea|l 5161-21-0715-00 Continental 130.00 ea
17 6" x 1 1/4” PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTUH CONTINENTAL(| 95.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID eal 5161-24-0715-00 Continental 130.00 ea
18 8" x11/4" PVC Fact Tap Saddle SPEARS|| 100.00 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea|| HT2-577837-212 SPEARS 150.00 ea
19 2" x 2" PVC Fast tap Saddle C516117071700 CONTINENTAL|| 85.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID eall 5161-17-0717-00 Continental 110.00 ea
20 2 1/2" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle FFTSLK FLOCONTROL|| 95.00 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea|| HT2-291829-020 SPEARS 100.00 ea
21 3" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTMK CONTINENTAL(| 95.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID eall 5161-19-0717-00 Continental 110.00 ea
22 4" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTPK CONTINENTAL|| 90.00 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID eall 5161-21-0717-00 Continental 105.00 ea
23 6" x 2" PVC Fast Tap Saddle CFTUK CONTINENTAL(| 90.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID eal 5161-24-2517-00 Continental 105.00 ea
24 8" x 2" pvc Fast Tap Saddle CFTXK CONTINENTAL|| 90.00 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea|| HT2-577829-020 SPEARS 115.00 ea
25 11/4" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW P40SCH SPEARS 0.59| ea 0.36. ea 429-012 Spears 0.70 ea
26 11/2" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW P40SCJ SPEARS 0.63 ea 0.38. ea 429-015 Spears 0.80 ea
27 2" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW P40SCK SPEARS 0.96| ea 0.60. ea 429-020 Spears 1.20 ea
28 2 1/2" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW P40SCL SPEARS 2.14 ea 1.37. ea 429-025 Spears 2.60 ea
29 3" PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW P40SCM SPEARS 335 ea 2.15. ea 429-030 Spears 4.00 ea
30 4" PVC GL Repair Coupling PPRGRCP HARCO|f 30.50 ea 32.80 ea 109-040 HARCO 24.00 ea
31 6" PVC GJ Repair Coupling PPRGRCU HARCO|| 53.00 ea 57.60 ea 109-060 Harco 42.00[ ea
32 8" PVC GJ Repair Coupling PPRGRCX HARCO|[ 110.00f ea 115.00 ea 109-080 Harco 85.00 ea
33 1 1/4" Brass Swing Check Valve PFX31H PROFLO|| 18.53| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 72050T|| AY MCDONALD 17.00 ea
34 11/2" Brass Swing Check Valve PFX31J PROFLO|| 24.85 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 72050T|f AY MCDONALD 23.00 ea
35 2" Brass Swing Check Valve PFX31K PROFLOf| 39.00|| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 72050T| AY MCDONALD 35.00 ea
36 2 1/2" Brass Swing Check Valve PFX31L PROFLO|| 74.91 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 72050T|f AY MCDONALD 69.00 ea
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37 11/4" Brass IPT Gate Valve PFXT300H PROFLO|| 17.50| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 72035T|| AY MCDONALD 15.75 ea
38 11/2" Brass IPT Valve PFXT300lJ PROFLO|f| 24.47| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 72035T| AY MCDONALD 20.00 ea
39 2" Brass IPT Gate Valve PFMT300K PROFLO|| 34.20| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 72035T|| AY MCDONALD 29.75 ea
40 2 1/2” Brass IPT Gate Valve PFMT300L PROFLO| 76.87| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 72035T| AY MCDONALD 56.00 ea
41 3” Brass IPT Gate Valve PFMT300M PROFLO|| 94.87|| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 72035T|| AY MCDONALD 80.00 ea
42 4” Brass IPT Gate Valve PFMT300P PROFLO|| 166.50| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 72035T| AY MCDONALD 142.00 ea
43 1 1/4"PVC Female Adapter P40SFAH SPEARS 0.69 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 435-012 SPEARS 1.00
44 11/4” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 P4A0SMAH SPEARS 0.59 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 436-012 SPEARS 1.00 ea
45 11/2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 P40SMAJ SPEARS 0.79 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 436-015 Spears 1.00 ea
46 2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 P40SMAK SPEARS 1.04| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 436-020 Spears 1.30 ea
47 2 1/2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 P40SMAL| SPEARS 3.06/ ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 436-025 Spears 3.75 ea
48 3” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 P4A0SMAM SPEARS 4.49 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 436-030 Spears 5.40 ea
49 4” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 P40SMAP SPEARS 5.73] ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 436-040 Spears 6.90 ea
50 11/4” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW P40S9H SPEARS 0.96| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 406-012 Spears 1.25 ea
51 11/2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW P40S9J SPEARS 1.03 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 406-015 Spears 1.35 ea
52 2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW P40S9K SPEARS 1.62 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 406-020 Spears 2.00 ea
53 2 1/2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW P40S9L| SPEARS 4.94{ ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 406-025 Spears 6.00 ea
54 3” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW P40SOM SPEARS 590 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 406-030 Spears 7.15 ea
55 4” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW P40S9P SPEARS| 10.56| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 406-040 Spears 12.70 ea
56 11/4” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW P4054 SPEARS 1.16) ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 417-012 Spears 1.50 ea
57 11/2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW P405) SPEARS 1.45 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 417-015 Spears 2.00 ea
58 2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW P4054K SPEARS 1.90|| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 417-020 Spears 2.30 ea
59 2 1/2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW P4054L SPEARS 4.94{ ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 417-025 Spears 7.40 ea
60 3” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW P4054M SPEARS 7.67|| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 417-030 Spears 9.30 ea
61 4” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW P4054P SPEARS| 13.76| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 417-040 Spears 16.50 ea
62 11/4” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW P4054H SPEARS 3.92 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 475-012 Spears 6.00 ea
63 11/2” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW P4054) SPEARS 5.03 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 475-015 Spears 6.25 ea
64 2” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW P4054K SPEARS| 15.09 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 475-020 Spears 18.25 ea
65 2 1/2” WYE SCH 40 SW P4054L SPEARS| 34.50| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 475-025 Spears 35.75 ea
66 3” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW P4054M SPEARS| 25.43 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 475-030 Spears 40.50 ea
67 4” PVC WYE SCH 40 SW P4054P SPEARS| 47.96| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 475-040 Spears 60.00 ea
68 11/4” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW P405TH SPEARS 1.12 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 401-012 Spears 1.50 ea
69 11/2” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW P405T) SPEARS 1.37| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 401-015 Spears 2.00 ea
70 2” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW P405TK SPEARS 2.00| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 401-020 Spears 2.40 ea
71 2 1/2” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW P405TL SPEARS 6.59 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 401-025 Spears 7.00 ea
72 3” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW P405TM SPEARS 8.66[ ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 401-030 Spears 10.00 ea
73 4” PVC TEE SCH 40 SW P405TP SPEARS|| 15.68| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 401-040 Spears 19.00 ea
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74 6” MJ TEE 101291 TYLER|| 125.33] ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 101291 Tyler, 92.00 ea
75 8” MJ TEE 101413 TYLER|| 171.58| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 101413 Tyler, 123.00 ea
76 2” X1 1/4” PVC SW Reducer P405BKJ SPEARS 1.20| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-250 Spears 3.60 ea
77 2” x11/2” PVC SW Reducer P405BKJ SPEARS 1.20| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-251 Spears 3.00 ea
78 2 1/2” x 2” SW Reducer P405BLK SPEARS 1.94| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-292 Spears 5.00 ea
79 3” x11/4” PVC SW Reducer P40SBMH SPEARS 2.86| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-336 SPEARS| 35.00 ea
80 3” x11/2 SW PVC Reducer P405BMJ SPEARS 2.86 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-337 Spears 15.00 ea
81 3” x 2” PVC SW Reducer P405BMK SPEARS 2.86| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-338 Spears 15.00 ea
82 3” x 2 1/2” PVC SW Reducer PA05BML| SPEARS 2.86 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-338 Spears 15.00 ea
83 4” x 1 1/4” PVC SW Reducer P405BPH SPEARS 7.85| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-418 Spears 40.00 ea
84 4” x 11/2” PVC SW Reducer PA405PP) SPEARS 7.85| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-418 Spears 45.00 ea
85 4” x 2” PVC SW Reducer P405BPK SPEARS 6.41 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-420 Spears 20.00 ea
86 4” x 2 1/2” PVC SW Reducer P405BPL| SPEARS 6.41] ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 429-421 Spears 25.00 ea
87 6” x 2” PVC SW Reducer P405BUK SPEARS|| 15.88| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-588F Spears 45.00 ea
88 6” x 3” PVC SW Reducer P405BUM SPEARS|| 15.88| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-530F Spears 45.00 ea
89 6” x 4” PVC SW Reducer P405BUP SPEARS|| 15.88| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-532 Spears 24.00 ea
90 8” x 2” PVC SW Reducer P405BXK SPEARS|| 62.63| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-578F Spears 115.00 ea
91 8” x 4” PVC SW Reducer P40SBXP SPEARS|| 55.35|| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 429-582 Spears 55.00 ea
92 11/4” PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCH FLOCONTROL 333 ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 2072 AY MCDONALD 3.00 ea
93 11/2” PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCJ FLOCONTROL 4.00 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 2072| AY MCDONALD 4.00 ea
94 2” PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCK FLOCONTROL 5.49] ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 2072| AY MCDONALD 5.50 ea
95 2 1/2” PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCL FLOCONTROL|| 11.20| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 2072| AY MCDONALD 10.00 ea
96 3” PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCM FLOCONTROL|| 14.85[ ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 2072| AY MCDONALD 14.85 ea
97 4” PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCP FLOCONTROL|| 22.60| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 2072|| AY MCDONALD 23.00 ea
98 6" PVC Compression Coupling PFPCCU FLOCONTROL|| 55.40| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 400T13| Matco - Narco 57.00 ea
99 8" PVC Compression Coupling K8605602176 HYMAX|| 240.00] ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea| 42108540983031 HYMAX|| 350.00 ea
100 11/4” PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS 0.63|f ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 447-012 Spears 1.00 ea
101 11/2” PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS 0.69| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 447-015 Spears 1.00 ea
102 2” PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS 0.83|f ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 447-020 Spears 1.00 ea
103 2 1/2” PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS 2.65 ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 447-025 Spears 3.00 ea
104 3” PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS 290 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 447-030 Spears 3.25 ea
105 4” PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS 6.59|| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 447-040 Spears 8.00 ea
106 6" PVC SW Cap P40SC SPEARS| 15.82| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 447-060 Spears 19.00 ea
107 8" PVC SW Cap P40sC SPEARS|| 39.74| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 447-080 Spears 40.00 ea
108 11/2” PVC GJ Cap 149-015 HARCO|| 11.87| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 149-015 Harco 15.00 ea
109 2” PVC GJ Cap 149-020 HARCO|| 13.00| ea NO BID NO BID|| NO BID ea 149-020 Harco 18.00 ea
110 21/2” PVC GJ Cap 149-025 HARCO|[ 20.00| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 149-025 Harco 32.00 ea
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111 3” PVC GJ Cap 149-030 HARCO|[ 21.80f ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 149-030 Harco 45.00 ea
112 4” PVC GJ Cap 149-040 HARCO|| 44.90| ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 149-040 Harco 55.00 ea
113 6" PVC GJ Cap 149-060 HARCO|[ 102.00f ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 149-060 Harco 100.00 ea
114 8" PVC GJ Cap MIJSCWAX TYLER]| 54.00f ea NO BID NO BID|[ NO BID ea 3747-0802 Naco 250.00 ea
115 11/4” IPT Galvanized Cap IGCAH MATCO 3.00 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea ZMGCAO6| Matco - Narco 3.25 ea
116 11/2” IPT Galvanized Cap IGCAJ MATCO 400 ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea ZMGCAOQ7| Matco - Narco 4.25 ea
117 20' Float with Weights NO BID NO BID|(NO BID ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 1006053 DeltaProcess 75.00 ea
118 30' Float with Weights NO BID NO BID|(NO BID ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea 1006053 DeltaProcess 75.00 ea
119 1 1/4" Galvenized Steel Nipple IGNHM MATCO 1.50|| ea NO BID NO BID|f NO BID ea N/A[ Matco - Narco 5.00 ea
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