
Bid Title Concrete Pipe

Bid Number SB-2015-PW-151

Effective Period August 1, 2016 - July 31, 2017 CONTRACT EXTENDED

Dept Personnel Division of Engineering & Public Works

Item#  Description  

8' SECTIONS

Reinforced 

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, 

Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, 

or Equal)

1 15" 107.44 T/G 103.60 T/G NO BID

2 18" 133.52 T/G 142.08 T/G NO BID

3 24" 204.00 T/G 216.8 T/G NO BID

4 30" 255.00 4-G 313.04 4 G 252.64 Modified

5 36" 360.00 4-G 407.04 4 G 356.64 Modified

6 42” 438.20 4-G 521.36 Modified 434.08 Modified

7 48" 554.10 4-G 658.96 Modified 548.72 T/G

8 54" 685.45 4-G 811.68 Modified 674.80 T/G

9 60" 834.65 4-G 984.24 Modified 972.72 T/G

10 72" 1,165.65 4-G 1376.4 Modified 1,275.84 T/G

8' SECTIONS

Reinforced with Gasket

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, 

Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, 

or Equal)

11 15" 114.40 T/G Ram Nek 103.60 T/G
NO BID

12 18" 141.20 T/G Ram Nek 142.08 T/G NO BID

13 24" 210.00 T/G Ram Nek 216.80 T/G
NO BID

14 30" 263.30

4-G

with/4G Gasket 313.04
4 G

260.64 Modified

15 36" 371.20

4-G

with/4G Gasket 407.04
4 G

367.84 Modified

16 42" 452.20

4-G

with/4G Gasket 521.36
Modified

447.84 Modified

17 48" 569.10

4-G

with/4G Gasket 658.96
Modified

566.08 T/G

18 54" 707.45

4-G

with/4G Gasket 811.68
Modified

696.16 T/G

19 60" 861.45

4-G

with/4G Gasket 984.24
Modified

1,003.60 T/G

20 72" 1,203.25

4-G

with/4G Gasket 1376.4
Modified

1,316.16 T/G

8' SECTIONS

Reinforced Arched 

(per joint)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, 

Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, 

or Equal)

21 18” X 11”  (15") 183.60 T/G 142.88 T/G 134.40 T/G

22 22” X 13”  (18") 187.20 T/G 177.12 T/G 166.56 T/G

23 28” X 18”  (24") 273.20 T/G 247.04 T/G 232.40 T/G

24 36” X 22”  (30") 334.40 T/G 297.92 T/G 273.04 T/G

25 43” X 26”  (36") 451.60 T/G 408.16 T/G 368.88 T/G

26 51” X 31”  (42") 602.40 T/G 542.88 T/G 491.44 T/G

27 58” X 36”  (48") 751.20 T/G 690.32 T/G 614.64 T/G

28 40" X 65" (54") 914.60 T/G 841.60 T/G 749.04 T/G

29 45" X 73" (60") 1,106.80 T/G 1,039.76 T/G 904.40 T/G

30 54" X 88" (72") 1,557.40 T/G 1,633.28 T/G 1,270.48 T/G

337-433-8895 (f) 228-831-2791 (f) 337-394-1093 (f)

10% Pref 10% Pref 10% Pref

Nebert LeJeune Eric Nichols Benny Corbello

337-433-3900 228-831-5833 337-394-3724

Vendor Vendor Vendor

DP CONCRETE PRODUCTS LLC Design Precast & Pipe Inc

FORTERRA 

(Formerly Hanson Pipe)
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Bid Title Concrete Pipe

Bid Number SB-2015-PW-151

Effective Period August 1, 2016 - July 31, 2017 CONTRACT EXTENDED

Dept Personnel Division of Engineering & Public Works

Item#  Description  
337-433-8895 (f) 228-831-2791 (f) 337-394-1093 (f)

10% Pref 10% Pref 10% Pref

Nebert LeJeune Eric Nichols Benny Corbello

337-433-3900 228-831-5833 337-394-3724

Vendor Vendor Vendor

DP CONCRETE PRODUCTS LLC Design Precast & Pipe Inc

FORTERRA 

(Formerly Hanson Pipe)

8' SECTIONS

Reinforced Arched with Gasket

(per joint)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, 

Modified, or 

Equal)

BID PRICE

PER JOINT

Pipe Design

(T/G, 4G, Modified, 

or Equal)

31 18” X 11”  (15") 187.60 T/G Ram Nek 142.88 T/G 138.24 T/G

32 22” X 13”  (18") 191.60 T/G Ram Nek 177.12 T/G 171.36 T/G

33 28” X 18”  (24") 279.60 T/G Ram Nek 247.04 T/G 239.04 T/G

34 36” X 22”  (30") 342.40 T/G Ram Nek 297.92 T/G 280.80 T/G

35 43” X 26”  (36") 462.80 T/G Ram Nek 408.16 T/G 379.44 T/G

36 51” X 31”  (42") 616.40 T/G Ram Nek 542.88 T/G 505.44 T/G

37 58” X 36”  (48") 771.20 T/G Ram Nek 690.32 T/G 632.16 T/G

38 40" X 65" (54") 939.60 T/G Ram Nek 841.60 T/G 770.40 T/G

39 45" X 73" (60") 1,136.80 T/G Ram Nek 1,039.76 T/G 930.24 T/G

40 54" X 88" (72") 1,592.40 T/G Ram Nek 1,633.28 T/G 1,343.12 T/G

Ramneck (Cost per Strip)

41 1" 3.00 NO BID NO BID

42 1 1/4" 3.90 NO BID NO BID

43 1 1/2" 5.50 NO BID NO BID

44 1 3/4" 8.40 NO BID NO BID

45 2" 10.90 NO BID NO BID

Ramneck (Cost per Box) Strips per Box Strips per Box  Strips per Box

46 1" (35 strips/box) 100.00 35 NO BID 75.00 35

47 1 1/4" (28 strips/box) 100.00 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID

48 1 1/2" (20 strips/box) 100.00 20 NO BID 80.00 20

49 1 3/4" (13 strips/box) 100.00 13 NO BID 80.00 13

50 2" (10 strips/box) 100.00 10 NO BID 80.00 10

Ramneck (Cost per Pallet) 

  (Boxes per pallet - 24)  Boxes per Pallet  Boxes per Pallet

51 1" 2,300.00 24 NO BID 1,600.00 24

52 1 1/4" 2,300.00 24 NO BID 1,600.00 24

53 1 1/2" 2,300.00 24 NO BID 1,600.00 24

54 1 3/4" 2,300.00 24 NO BID 1,600.00 24

55 2" 2,300.00 24 NO BID 1,600.00 24
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