Vendor

Vendor

BID Title:

Creosoted Bridge Lumber

Bayou Forest Products, Inc.

MCFARLAND CASCADE
HOLDINGS, INC (Formerly
Kisatchie Treating)

Bid Number

SB-2015-PW-152

Jacob Williams

Kenneth Busby

Effective Period

August 1, 2016-July 31, 2017 cONTRACT EXTENDED

337-528-8500

318-840-8660

Department Personnel

Div of Engineering & Public Works

337-528-8501 (f)

318-645-7530 (f)

SECTION ONE (Per Board)

10% Preference

ltem# Measure 12# 12#
113X8X20 Per Board 62.00 58.00
2|13X8X24 Per Board 79.68 74.00
3|13X8X26 Per Board 89.18 80.00
4/13X8X28 Per Board 99.12 91.00
5/3X8X32 Per Board 120.32 117.20
6/3X10X 20 Per Board 77.50 72.00
7|13X10X24 Per Board 99.60 92.00
8/3X10X 26 Per Board 111.48 99.50
9|3X10X 28 Per Board 123.90 103.00

10|13 X 10X 32 Per Board 150.40 146.00
Measure 16# 16#
11|13X8X20 Per Board 65.40 62.00
12|3X8X24 Per Board 83.76 78.80
13|13X8X26 Per Board 93.60 85.20
14/3X8X 28 Per Board 103.88 97.20
153X 8X32 Per Board 125.76 123.60
16|13 X 10X 20 Per Board 81.75 81.00
17|3X10X 24 Per Board 104.70 98.00
18|13 X 10X 26 Per Board 117.00 106.00
19|3X10X 28 Per Board 129.85 121.00
20|13 X 10X 32 Per Board 157.20 154.00
21/4X12X 14 Per Board 91.56 86.00
22|14X12X 16 Per Board 104.64 98.00
2314X12X 18 Per Board 121.68 110.00
24|14X12X 20 Per Board 139.60 122.00
25/4x12x 26 Per Board 198.64 168.40
26|6X12X 18 Per Board 182.52 192.00
27|16 X12X 20 Per Board 209.40 212.00
28|16 X12X 22 Per Board 237.60 241.20
29/6X12X 24 Per Board 267.12 260.40
30/8x 16 x 20 Per Board 401.07 520.00
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Vendor Vendor
MCFARLAND CASCADE
HOLDINGS, INC (Formerly
BID Title: Creosoted Bridge Lumber Bayou Forest Products, Inc. Kisatchie Treating)
Bid Number SB-2015-PW-152 Jacob Williams Kenneth Busby
Effective Period August 1, 2016-July 31, 2017 cONTRACT EXTENDED 337-528-8500 318-840-8660
Department Personnel Div of Engineering & Public Works 337-528-8501 (f) 318-645-7530 (f)
SECTION ONE (Per Board) 10% Preference
Measure 16# 16#
31|8x16x 22 Per Board 454.08 568.00
32|112X12X 20 Per Board 418.80 424.00
33|12X12X 24 Per Board 534.24 529.60
34/12X 12X 26 Per Board 595.92 570.60
35(12X 12X 28 Per Board 660.24 644.80
36/12X 16 X 28 Per Board 1,003.52 1,227.20
37|12X 16 X 32 Per Board 1,203.20 1,499.20
38(12X 16 X 36 Per Board 1,700.00 1,912.00
39|16 x 16 x 24 Per Board NO BID 1,509.20
40|16 x 16 x 26 Per Board NO BID 1,741.70
SECTION TWO (Per Board)

Item# Measure 16# 16#
41/12" Butt - 15 feet NO BID 175.00
42|12" Butt - 20 feet Per Board NO BID 220.00
43|12" Butt - 25 feet Per Board NO BID 250.00
44/12" Butt - 30 feet Per Board NO BID 300.00
45|12" Butt - 35 feet Per Board NO BID 350.00
46/12" Butt - 40 feet Per Board NO BID 425.00
47|12" Butt - 45 feet Per Board NO BID 470.00
48/12" Butt - 50 feet Per Board NO BID 575.00
49/16" Butt- 35 feet Per Board NO BID 900.00
50|16" Butt-40 feet NO BID 1,030.00

Treating Facility & Texas Electric Cooperatives Kisatchie Treating
Location Jasper TX Pineville LA
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