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1 2” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 16.00 ea 13420 FORD 15.21 ea  570-203 FORD 18.61 ea  570-203

2 2” x 1” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 16.00 ea 13420 FORD 15.21 ea S70-204 FORD 18.61 ea S70-204

3 4” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 24.95 ea 13428 FORD 23.17 ea S70-403 FORD 28.88 ea S70-403

4 4” x 1” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 24.95 ea 13428 FORD 24.33 ea S70-404 FORD 28.88 ea S70-404

5 4” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle MUELLER 55.00 ea 13478 FORD 51.31 ea S71-406 FORD 62.21 ea S71-406

6 4” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle MUELLER 55.00 ea 13478 FORD 50.86 ea S70-406 FORD 62.21 ea S70-406

7 4” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle MUELLER 55.00 ea 13478 FORD 50.86 ea S71-407 FORD 62.21 ea S71-407

8 6” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 37.25 ea 13431 FORD 35.55 ea S70-603 FORD 43.00 ea S70-603

9 6” x 1” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 37.92 ea 13431 FORD 35.55 ea S70-604 FORD 43.00 ea S70-604

10 6” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle MUELLER 71.45 ea 13481 FORD 66.48 ea S71-606 FORD 81.25 ea S71-606

11 6” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle MUELLER 71.45 ea 13431 FORD 66.48 ea S70-606 FORD 81.25 ea S70-606

12 6” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle MUELLER 71.45 ea 13481 FORD 66.48 ea S71-607 FORD 81.25 ea S71-607

13 8” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 51.66 ea 13433 FORD 48.41 ea S70-803 FORD 59.23 ea S70-803

14 8” x 1” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 51.66 ea 13433 FORD 48.41 ea S70-804 FORD 59.23 ea S70-804

15 8” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle MUELLER 73.16 ea 13483 FORD 68.54 ea S71-806 FORD 83.85 ea S71-806

16 8” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle MUELLER 73.16 ea 13433 FORD 68.54 ea S70-806 FORD 83.85 ea S70-806

17 8” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle MUELLER 73.16 ea 13483 FORD 68.54 ea S71-807 FORD 83.85 ea S71-807

18 12” x 3/4” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 138.00 ea 13435 FORD 124.27 ea S70-1203 FORD 152.00 ea S70-1203

19 12” x 1” CC Brass Saddle MUELLER 138.00 ea 13435 FORD 124.27 ea S70-1204 FORD 152.00 ea S70-1204

20 12” x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Saddle AY MCDONALD 190.00 ea 3802 FORD 152.73 ea S71-1206 FORD 175.63 ea S71-1206

21 12” x 1 1/2” CTS Brass Saddle AY MCDONALD 190.00 ea 3801 FORD 143.57 ea S70-1206 FORD 175.63 ea S70-1206

22 12” x 2” IPT Brass Saddle AY MCDONALD 190.00 ea 3802 FORD 143.57 ea S71-1207 FORD 175.63 ea S71-1207
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23 2” (2.35-2.63) F.C. Clamp x 12” MUELLER 51.50 ea 5500120235 FORD 49.70 ea FS1-263-125 SMITHBLAIR 63.75 ea 226023812

24 4” (4.45-4.73) F.C. Clamp x 12” MUELLER 66.00 ea 500-12-0474 FORD 65.08 ea FS1-473-125 SMITHBLAIR 69.50 ea 226045012

25 6” (6.56-6.96) F.C. Clamp x 12” MUELLER 79.00 ea 500-12-0655 FORD 78.23 ea FS1-696-125 SMITHBLAIR 80.00 ea 276066312

26 8” (8.54-8.94) F.C. Clamp x 12” MUELLER 95.00 ea 500-12-0853 FORD 91.99 ea FS1-894-125 SMITHBLAIR 95.00 ea 226086312

27 12” (12.62-13.02) F.C. Clamp x 12” MUELLER 148.00 ea 500-12-1260 FORD 140.74 ea FS1-1302-125 SMITHBLAIR 150.00 ea 226127512

28 2” PVC GJ Repair Coupling HARCO 12.00 ea 109-020 HARCO 11.52. ea HARCO ea PPRGRCK

29 4” PVC GJ Repair Coupling HARCO 23.00 ea 109-040 HARCO 28.51 ea HARCO 30.50 ea PPRGRCP

30 6” PVC GJ Repair Coupling HARCO 48.00 ea 109-060 HARCO 50.10 ea HARCO 53.00 ea PPRGRCU

31 8” PVC GJ Repair Coupling HARCO 100.00 ea 109-080 HARCO 103.21 ea HARCO 110.00 ea PPRGRCX

32 2” MJ Repair Coupling TYLER 43.00 ea 507376 SIGMA 45.84 ea TYLER 50.87 ea MJLSLAK

33 4” MJ Repair Coupling TYLER 35.00 ea 137375 SIGMA 37.42 ea TYLER 51.33 ea MJLSLAP

34 6” MJ Repair Coupling TYLER 65.00 ea 137399 SIGMA 62.76. ea TYLER 80.00 ea MJLSWAU

35 8” MJ Repair Coupling TYLER 100.00 ea 137412 SIGMA 103.06 ea TYLER 116.00 ea MJLSWAX

36 12” MJ Repair Coupling TYLER 175.00 ea 137337 SIGMA 173.71 ea TYLER 172.37 ea MJLSWA12

37 3/4” CTS Brass Compression Coupling MUELLER 14.25 ea P15403 FORD 14.12 ea C4433NL FORD 17.12 ea C4433NL

38 1” CTS Brass Compression Coupling MUELLER 15.50 ea P15403 FORD 16.15 ea C4444NL FORD 19.58 ea C4444NL

39 1 1/2” CTS Brass Compression Coupling MUELLER 56.00 ea P15403 FORD 53.49 ea C4466NL FORD 65.52 ea C4466NL

40 2” CTS Brass Compression Coupling MUELLER 73.00 ea P15403 FORD 72.71 ea C4477NL FORD 88.46 ea C4477NL

41 2” IPS Brass Compression Coupling MUELLER 114.00 /ft E15404 FORD 102.27 /ft C7777NL FORD 125.27 /ft C7777NL

42 3/4” IPS PVC Compression Coupling AY MCDONALD 2.30 /ft 2072 JS 1.49 /ft C12-075 PROFLO 2.30 /ft PFPCCF

43 1” IPS PVC Compression Coupling AY MCDONALD 3.00 /ft 2072 JS 2.00 /ft C12-100 PROFLO 3.00 /ft PFPCCG

44 1 1/2” IPS PVC Compression Coupling AY MCDONALD 4.00 /ft 2072 JS 3.56 /ft C12-150 PROFLO 4.00 /ft PFPCCJ

45 2” IPS PVC Compression Coupling AY MCDONALD 6.00 /ft 2072 JS 4.78 /ft C12-200 PROFLO 5.49 /ft PFPCCK
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46 3/4” SCH 40 PVC Pipe JM-EAGLE 0.40 /ft N/A JET STREAM 0.15. /ft SANDERSON 0.30 /ft P40BEF

47 1” SCH 40 PVC Pipe JM-EAGLE 0.50 /ft N/A JET STREAM 0.25. /ft SANDERSON 0.40 /ft P40BEG

48 1 1/2” SCH 40 PVC Pipe JM-EAGLE 0.75 /ft N/A JET STREAM 0.37. /ft SANDERSON 0.59 /ft P40BEJ

49 2” SCH 40 PVC Pipe JM-EAGLE 1.00 /ft N/A JET STREAM 0.44. /ft SANDERSON 0.79 /ft P40BEK

50 2” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 VINYLPLEX 0.50 /ft N/A 0.42. /ft SANDERSON 0.60 /ft SDR26PK

51 4” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 VINYLPLEX 1.20 /ft N/A 1.15. /ft DIAMOND 1.26 /ft SDR26PP

52 6” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 VINYLPLEX 2.40 /ft N/A 2.48 /ft DIAMOND 2.73 /ft SDR26PU

53 8” PVC GJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 VINYLPLEX 4.07 /ft N/A 4.22 /ft DIAMOND 4.64 /ft SDR26PX

54 12” PVCGJ Pipe Class 160 SDR 26 VINYLPLEX 9.00 /ft N/A 9.24 /ft DIAMOND 10.14 /ft SDR26P12

55 12” GJ PVC C900 Pipe Class 150 SDR 18 VINYLPLEX 10.00 /ft N/A 13.38 /ft DIAMOND 15.63 /ft DR18PP12

56 3/4” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 ADS 0.21 /ft 3/4 CTS 0.22 /ft ADS 0.25 /ft PEC9AF500

57 1” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 ADS 0.32 /ft 1 CTS 0.35 /ft ADS 0.35 /ft PEC9AG300

58 1 1/2” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 ADS 0.70 /ft 1-1/2 CTS 0.58. /ft ADS 0.80 /ft PEC9AJ100

59 1 1/2” IPS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 ADS 1.40 /ft 1-1/2 IPS 0.91. /ft ADS 1.75 /ft PEI9NJ

60 2” CTS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 ADS 1.15 /ft 2 CTS 1.16 /ft ADS 1.20 /ft PEC9AJ100

61 2” IPS PE Tubing Class 200 SDR 9 ADS 1.65 /ft 2 IPS 1.18. /ft UPS 1.20 /ft PEI9AK100

62 4” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 3.00 /ft N/A 3.39 /ft UPS 2.60 /ft PEI11AP40

63 4” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 4.25 /ft N/A 4.35 /ft UPS 4.25 /ft PED11AP40

64 6” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 7.35 /ft N/A 7.24 /ft UPS 6.30 /ft PEI11AP40

65 6” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 7.35 ea N/A 7.85 ea UPS 6.30 ea PED11AP40

66 8” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 11.50 ea N/A 11.32 ea UPS 9.10 ea PEI11APX40

67 8” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 14.20 ea N/A 13.71 ea UPS 10.20 ea PEI11APX40

68 12” PE Pipe IPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 29.00 ea N/A 27.13 ea UPS 21.00 ea PEI11A1240
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69 12” PE Pipe DIPS Class 160 SDR 11 PERFORMANCE PIPE 31.00 ea N/A 27.53 ea UPS 22.00 ea PEI11A1240

70 2” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 280.00 A236023 NO BID NO BID ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 333.00 2502

71 4” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 440.00 ea A236023 NO BID NO BID ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 469.00 ea 2504

72 6” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 561.00 ea A236023 NO BID NO BID ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 607.00 ea 2506

73 10” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 900.00 ea A236023 NO BID NO BID ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 945.00 ea 2508

74 8” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 1500.00 ea A236023 NO BID NO BID ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 1469.41 ea 2510

75 12” MJ Gate Valve
AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTOL 1800.00 ea A236023 NO BID NO BID ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 1856.47 ea 2512

76 2” IPT Gate Valve
MUELLER 270.00 ea A236008 M&H 240.43. ea

AMERICAN FLOW 

CONTROL 284.00 ea AFC2502

77 1 1/2” Brass Gate Valve AY MCDONALD 20.00 ea 72035T 21.69 ea PROFLO 24.47 ea PFXT300J

78 2” Brass Gate Valve AY MCDONALD 30.00 ea 72035T 33.70 ea PROFLO 34.20 ea PFXT300K

79 1 1/2 “ Brass Ball Valve AY MCDONALD 29.00 ea 72032T 19.83. ea PROFLO 32.25 ea FNWX410CJ

80 2” Brass Ball Valve AY MCDONALD 37.61 ea 72032T 33.31. ea PROFLO 53.25 ea FNWX410CK

81 3/4” Curb Stop MTR Nut x Comp MUELLER 37.00 ea P24350 FORD 34.47 ea B43232WNL FORD 42.22 ea B43232W

82 1” Curb Stop MTR Nut x CTS Comp MUELLER 67.00 ea P24350 FORD 63.47 ea B43344WNL FORD 77.75 ea B43344NL

83 1 1/2” Curb Stop MTR FLG x CTS Comp MUELLER 147.00 ea P24335 FORD 138.10 ea BF43666WNL FORD 160.83 ea BF43666WNL

84 2” Curb Stop MTR FLG x CTS Comp MUELLER 250.00 ea P24335 FORD 233.93 ea BF43777WNL FORD 272.45 ea BF43777WNL

85 2” Curb Stop MTR FLG x IPS Comp AY MCDONALD 290.00 ea 76100MW-22 FORD 246.76 ea BF73777WNL FORD 287.40 ea BF73777WNL

86 3/4” Corp Stop CC x CTS Comp MUELLER 26.00 ea P15008 FORD 24.78 ea F10003NL FORD 30.67 ea F110003NL

87 1” Corp Stop CC x CTS Comp MUELLER 39.75 ea P15008 FORD 37.47 ea F10004NL FORD 46.37 ea F10004NL

88 1 1/2” Corp Stop IPT x Comp MUELLER 110.00 ea P25028 FORD 108.04 ea FB11006NL FORD 133.75 ea FB11006NL

Page 4 of 9



Bid Title:

Bid Number:

Effective:
Dept Personnel:

Item # Description Brand Name Price UOM

Product

Code Brand Name Price UOM

Product

Code Brand Name Price UOM

Product

Code

Division of Engineering & Public Works 337-269-1130 F 337-474-0987 F 337-625-2629 (f)

SB-2016-PW-141 337-269-0032 337-474-0526 337-625-3300

August 1, 2016 - January 31, 2017 Bryan Lavergne John Drost Jerry Mayeaux

Vendor Vendor Vendor

Distribution Pipe & Fittings

Lafayette Winwater Works Coburn Supply Co. Louisiana Utilities Supply

89 2” Corp Stop IPT x Comp MUELLER 185.00 ea P25028 FORD 178.68 ea FB11007NL FORD 221.00 ea FB11007NL

90 3/4” Brass Meter Coupling BWC 5.50 ea 34MC FORD 7.38 ea C38-23-25NL BWS 5.40 ea M74620F

91 1” Brass Meter Coupling BWC 9.00 ea 1MC FORD 11.47 ea C38-44-625NL BWS 8.00 ea M74620G

92 1 1/2” Brass Male Adapter MIP x CTS Comp MUELLER 39.00 ea P15428 FORD 36.85 ea C8466NL FORD 45.60 ea C8466NL

93 2” Brass Adapter MIP x CTS Comp MUELLER 56.00 ea P15428 FORD 53.70 ea C8477NL FORD 66.45 ea C8477NL

94 2” Brass Adapter MIP x IPS Comp MUELLER 74.00 ea E15429 FORD 67.09 ea C8777NL FORD 83.00 ea C8777NL

95 1 1/2” Brass Female Adapter FIP x CTS Comp MUELLER 49.00 ea P15451 FORD 47.14 ea C1466NL FORD 58.33 ea C1466NL

96 2” Female Adapter FIP x CTS Comp MUELLER 58.75 ea P15451 FORD 56.13 ea C1477NL FORD 69.46 ea C1477NL

97 2” Female Adapter FIP x IPS Comp MUELLER 75.00 ea E15454 FORD 77.08 ea C1777NL FORD 95.38 ea C1777NL

98 1” x 2” Brass Nipple AY MCDONALD 3.00 ea 12BN 3.01 ea MERIT 3.00 ea GBRNGK

99 1 1/2” x 2” Brass Nipple AY MCDONALD 5.00 ea 1122BN 5.15 ea MERIT 5.00 ea GBRNJK

100 2” x 2” Brass Nipple AY MCDONALD 7.00 ea 22BN 7.28 ea MERIT 7.12 ea GBRNKK

101 3" x 1 1/4" Brass Nipple AY MCDONALD 27.00 ea 3CLBN 32.11 ea MERIT 5.50 ea GBRNHM

102 1 1/2” CI Meter Flange Kit BWS 30.00 ea 7610FN 23.97 ea BWS 22.90 ea BCMFCSJ

103 2” CI Meter Flange Kit BWS 35.00 ea 7610FN 30.64 ea BWS 19.00 ea BCMFCSK

104 3/4” Dual Check Valve MTR Nut x FIP MUELLER 45.00 ea 014242 215W FORD 49.64 ea HHC-31-323-NL MULLER 39.62 ea 014242F

105 1” Dual Check Valve MTR Nut x FIP MUELLER 75.00 ea 014242 FORD 91.74 ea HHC-31-444-NL MULLER 61.67 ea 014242G

106 1 1/2” Dual Check Valve MTR FLG x FIP MUELLER 175.00 ea 014242 NO BID NO BID ea MULLER 165.00 ea 014242J

107 2” Dual Check Valve MTR FLG x FIP MUELLER 185.00 ea 014242 NO BID NO BID ea MULLER 200.00 ea 014242K

108 3/4” PVC 90 Ell SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 406-007 SPEARS 0.19. ea SPEARS 0.30 ea P4059F

109 1” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 406-010 SPEARS 0.36. ea SPEARS 0.54 ea P4059G

110 1 1/2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.35 ea 406-015 SPEARS 0.68. ea SPEARS 1.03 ea P4059J

111 2” PVC 90 ELL SCH 40 SW SPEARS 2.00 ea 406-020 SPEARS 1.06. ea SPEARS 1.62 ea P4059K
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112 3/4” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 417-007 SPEARS 0.45. ea SPEARS 0.69 ea P4054F

113 1 1/2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW SPEARS 2.00 ea 417-015 SPEARS 1.04. ea SPEARS 1.45 ea P4054J

114 2” PVC 45 ELL SCH 40 SW SPEARS 2.30 ea 417.020 SPEARS 1.36. ea SPEARS 1.90 ea P4054K

115 3/4” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 436-007 SPEARS 0.18. ea SPEARS 0.26 ea P405MAF

116 1” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 436-010 SPEARS 0.32. ea SPEARS 0.48 ea P405MAG

117 1 1/2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 436-015 SPEARS 0.57. ea SPEARS 0.79 ea P405MAJ

118 2” PVC Male Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.30 ea 436-020 SPEARS 0.68. ea SPEARS 1.04 ea P405MAK

119 3/4” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 435-007 SPEARS 0.25. ea SPEARS 0.38 ea P405FAF

120 1” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 435-010 SPEARS 0.32. ea SPEARS 0.44 ea P405FAG

121 1 1/2” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.50 ea 435-015 SPEARS 0.57. ea SPEARS 0.79 ea P405FAJ

122 2” PVC Female Adapter SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.75 ea 435-020 0.76. ea SPEARS 1.06 ea P405FAK

123 3/4” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 429-007 0.16. ea SPEARS 0.25 ea P405CF

124 1” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 429-010 0.28. ea SPEARS 0.42 ea P405CG

125 1 1/2” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 429-015 0.42. ea SPEARS 0.63 ea P405CJ

126 2” PVC Coupling SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.50 ea 429-020 0.63. ea SPEARS 0.96 ea P405CK

127 3/4” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 447-007 0.19. ea SPEARS 0.28 ea P405CAF

128 1” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 447-010 0.32. ea SPEARS 0.44 ea P405CAG

129 1 1/2” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.00 ea 447-015 0.50. ea SPEARS 0.69 ea P405CAJ

130 2” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 1.25 ea 447-020 0.60. ea SPEARS 0.83 ea P405CAK

131 4” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 8.00 ea 447-040 4.72. ea SPEARS 6.59 ea P405CAP

132 6” PVC Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 19.00 ea 447-060 11.33. ea SPEARS 15.82 ea P405CAU

133 8” PVS Cap SCH 40 SW SPEARS 40.00 ea 447-080 28.45. ea SPEARS 39.74 ea P405CAX
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134 12” PVC Cap SCH 40SW SPEARS 135.00 ea 447-120 212.14 ea SPEARS 128.70 ea P405CA12

135 2” Flush Hydrant GIL 460.00 ea 3' POST MOINGAURO 448.31 ea #77 KUPFERLE 472.00 ea K77

136 2-way Hydrant 3’ 6” Bury
MUELLER 1640.00 ea A-420 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 1728.00 ea MAY20

137 3-way Hydrant 3’ 6” Bury
MUELLER 1760.00 ea A-423 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 1800.00 ea MAY23

138 2 1/2” Hydrant Nozzle Wrench MUELLER 104.00 ea 143129 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 120.00 ea 143129

139 4 1/2” Nozzle Wrench MUELLER 107.00 ea 143131 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 130.00 ea 143131

140 2 1/2” Hose Nozzle MUELLER 65.00 ea 143116-75298 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 95.00 ea 143116 75298

141 4 1/2” Hose Nozzle MUELLER 200.00 ea 143124-40560 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 260.00 ea 143124 40560

142 2 1/2” Hose Nozzle Cap MUELLER 65.00 ea 158661-75298 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 95.00 ea 158661 75298

143 4 1/2” Hose Nozzle Cap MUELLER 150.00 ea 158668-40560 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 175.00 ea 158668 40560

144 Hydrant Wrench MUELLER 30.00 ea 174510 20.80. ea RAPTOR 28.95 ea 41002

145 Hydrant Safety Flange Kit
MUELLER 195.00 ea A301 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 186.00 ea A301

146 Hydrant Oil (10oz.) MUELLER 17.00 ea 280354 NO BID NO BID ea Mueller 20.00 ea 280354

147 Cast Iron Meter Box Lids SMB 20.00 ea THL 22.08 ea SMB 23.50 ea 55834TH0L

148 5/8” x 3/4” Water Meters MASTER METER 56.69 ea 3/4 MM Badger 44.50. ea HERSEY 52.40 ea HV0GB202

149 1” Turbine Meters MASTER METER 125.00 ea 1MM Badger 124.00. ea HERSEY 187.92 ea HVOKS202

150 2” Compound Meter MASTER METER 1393.00 ea D31A1A030101A1 Badger 1265.00 ea RG3 1200.00 ea CM20GEB

151 3” Compound Meter MASTER METER 1819.00 ea D32A1A030101A1 Badger 1500.00. ea RG3 1540.00 ea CM30GEB

152 3/4” Angle Grip Joint In x 3/4” Grip Joint Dual Check Valve Straight Out
MUELLER 250.00 ea N/A NO BID NO BID ea FORD 198.00 ea YLHC2Y7233G

153 Barrel Locks for 3/4” Curb Stops HIGHFIELD 3.60 ea 93180124 3.83 ea HIGH FIELD 3.70 ea H93780124

154 Barrel Meter Lock Keys HIGHFIELD 43.00 ea 93480136 60.92 ea HIGH FIELD 41.83 ea B8610005
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155 Blue Inverted Spray Marking Paint (12 oz.) EGW 3.65 ea 04105 5.07 ea AERVOE 3.87 ea AER203

156 Green Inverted Spray Marking Paint (12 oz.) EGW 3.65 ea 04106 5.07 ea AERVOE 3.87 ea AER204

157 3/4” Brass Grip Joint In & Out Dual Check Valve AY MCDONALD 195.00 ea 775208PDVV332 NO BID NO BID ea FORD 79.00 ea HHCC11333NGL

158 3/4” Angle Stop, Grip Joining In x Meter Connection Out AY MCDONALD 195.00 ea 775208LDVV332 FORD 33.99 ea BA43-232WNL FORD 66.97 ea BA43332WN

159 1 1/2” Water Meter Turbine BADGER METER 650.00 ea T160 Badger 493.00 ea HERSEY 393.00 ea MVR100

160 2” Water Meter Turbine MASTER METER 660.00 ea T31A1A030101A1 Badger 557.00 ea RG3 550.00 ea RG3TWM250

161 3/4” - 1” Meter Box Plastic DFW 22.00 ea D1200 14.44. ea DFW 14.50 ea DFW1200

162 3/4” - 1” Meter Box Concrete SMB 38.00 ea THL 31.80 ea SMB 30.00 ea SCH583412

163 2” Meter Box Plastic DFW 32.00 ea D1500 27.75. ea DFW 28.00 ea DFW1500

164 2” Meter Box Concrete SMB 125.00 ea TH2 63.22. ea SMB 103.00 ea SCH212

165 3” Water Meter Turbine MASTER METER 916.25 ea T32A1A030101A1 Badger 650.00. ea RG3 650.00 ea RTM30GEBL

166 3” Compound Meter MASTER METER 1819.25 ea D32A1A03061A1 Badger 1500.00. ea RG3 1550.00 ea CM30GEB

167 4” Water Meter Turbine MASTER METER 1260.13 ea T33A1A030101A1 Badger 990.00. ea RG3 1000.00 ea RTMYUGEBL

168 4” Compound Meter MASTER METER 2352.00 ea D33A1A030101A1 Badger 2410.00 ea RG3 2200.00 ea REM40GEB

169 6” Water Meter Turbine MASTER METER 1987.00 ea T34A1A030101A1 Badger 2460.00 ea RG3 1940.00 ea RTM60GEBL

170 6” Compound Meter MASTER METER 4345.00 ea D34A1A030101A1 Badger 3500.00. ea RG3 3600.00 ea REM60GEB

171 3/4” Stainless Steel Insert for CTS Size Polyethylene Tubing BWS 0.90 ea PI35 1.15 ea BWS 1.20 ea F51

172 3/4” Stainless Steel Insert for IPS Size Polyethylene Tubing AY MCDONALD 1.55 ea 6138 1.42. ea FORD 2.00 ea S71

173 1” Stainless Steel Insert for CTS Size Polyethylene Tubing BWS 1.00 ea PI15 1.26 ea BWS 1.25 ea F52

174 1” Stainless Steel Insert for IPS Size Polyethylene Tubing AY MCDONALD 1.75 ea 6138 1.51. ea FORD 2.20 ea S5372

175 3/4” x 1/8” Rubber Meter Gasket BWS 1.00 ea R308 0.09. ea BWS 0.15 ea MRGF18

176 1” x 1/8” Rubber Meter Gasket BWS 1.25 ea R108 0.11. ea BWS 0.16 ea MRGG18

177
2” x 13” Long C110 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with Accessories for Class 

160 Pipe TYLER 220.00 ea 086260 52.51. ea TYLER 75.38 ea MJLSLAK

178
4” x 12” Long C153 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with Accessories for Class 

160 PVC Pipe TYLER 75.00 ea 137351 44.91. ea TYLER 51.33 ea MJLSWAP

179
6” x 12” Long C153 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with Accessories for Class 

160 PVC Pipe TYLER 105.00 ea 137399 75.31. ea TYLER 80.00 ea MJLSWAU
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180
8” x 12” Long C153 Mechanical Joint Sleeve with Accessories for Class 

160 PVC Pipe TYLER 150.00 ea 137412 123.67 ea TYLER 116.00 ea MJLSWAX

181 2" Stainless Steel Inserts for IPS AY MCDONALD 5.00 ea 6138 2.89. ea FORD 3.25 ea S75

182 2" Stainless Steel Inserts for CTS BWS 2.35 ea Insert55 1.69. ea BWS ea F55

183 2" Flange Gasket and Bolt Kits BWS 5.60 ea N/A 3.71. ea SIGMA 4.00 ea FGP082

184 1" Compression x 3/4" Meter nut Curb Stop (no pack joint) MUELLER 60.00 ea P24350 FORD 62.11 ea B43342WNL FORD 65.76 ea B43342WGNL

185 Permanent Automatic Flushing Station with 1" piping HYDROGAURD 2250.00 ea HG2SI01000 NO BID NO BID ea KUPFERLE 2336.00 ea 9800WC-A

186 Permanent Automatic Flushing Station with 2" piping HYDROGAURD 2450.00 ea HG2SI02000 NO BID NO BID ea KUPFERIE 2589.00 ea 9800WC

187
Permanent Sampling Station for warm climates with A W W A thread or 

adaptor HYDROGAURD 630.00 ea BSS0512 MOEDG NO BID NO BID ea KUPFERIE 673.31 ea 88WE

188 6" x 1-1/4" Brass Nipple NO BID NO BID ea NO BID NO BID NO BID ea . MERIT 10.56 ea GBRNHU

189 6” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary bolts and gaskets HYMAX 190.00 ea 860-56-0163-16 . 185.16 ea . KRAUSZ USA 212.00 ea K86056016316

190 8” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary bolts and gaskets HYMAX 214.00 ea 860-56-0217-16 . 209.05 ea . KRAUSZ. 240.00 ea K86056021716

191 10” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary bolts and gaskets HYMAX 275.00 ea 860-56-0272-16 . 268.93 ea . KRAUSZ. 333.00 ea K86056027816

192 12” Hymax Repair Couplings with all necessary bolts and gaskets HYMAX 325.00 ea 860-56-0315-16 . 317.43 ea . KRAUSZ. 440.00 ea K86056033416

193 6” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS ROMAC 155.00 ea 517-6.63 FORD 76.51 ea FBC-663 FORD 117.00 ea FBC663 

194 8” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS ROMAC 216.00 ea 517-8.63 FORD 104.77 ea FBC-863 FORD 162.00 ea FBC863

195 10” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS ROMAC 271.00 ea 517-10.75 FORD 131.00 ea FBC-1075 FORD 203.00 ea FBC1075

196 12” Bell Joint Leak Repair Clamps IPS ROMAC 294.00 ea 517-12.75 FORD 142.00 ea FBC-1275 FORD 220.00 ea FBC1275
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